ITB 23-25 "SCHOOL FURNITURE"
VALERIE HENDERSON/ PURCHASING COORDINATOR
DOMONIQUE ANDREWS/ BUYER

BID TABULATION

TEM DESCRIPTION LAKESHORE LEARNING MATERIALS, LLC OFFFICE RESOURCES INC. DIVISION 12 CONSULTING
ITEM # ITEM PHOTO PART # PRICE PER BRAND/ MFG BRAND/ MFG PRICE PER BRAND/ MFG PRICE PER
"Or Approved Equal” BRAND/ MFG NAME | PRODUCT CODE# PRODUCT CODE# | PRICE PER UNIT PRODUCT CODE# PRODUCT CODE#
PP a UNIT NAME NAME UNIT NAME UNIT
GROUP A. TABLES
, wB RCWT605436C . ]
1 WORK TABLE { WB-CLW6107 No Bid ) 42044 $1,412.99 Kil $2,614.06 Wisconsin Bench| CLW-6107-343430 | $3,265.00
Manufacturing OP-RNT
Lakeshore Learning |Lak e Alternate HMPTT2460
- SICO-TUD31WQG 645.05 H 42044 832.99 HON 388.03 Sico/Multi-Aj TUC31WQG?? 1,046.00
2 MULTI-APP TABLE L“ = Q Materials, LLC Item #LC759 $ on $ HMPTBFI $ SR Q $
L i L
3 COLLABORATION TABLE SICO-EDAC11B2-2 ) Learning eAlternate] 15,05 HON 42044 $797.99 HON HTLC3096HCTP $906.54 Sico/Alliance EDAC11B2-2 $4,030.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC759
L Learning |L e Alternate HBTTSQR42 .
4 SQUARE TABLE SICO-EDTT14A-36! 645.05 Hon 42044 353.99 HON 445.45 sico EDTT14A-36S 691.00
Q & Q Materials, LLC Item #LC681 $ $ HBTTD30 $ Q $
5 ROUND FOLDING TABLE { NPS-BTR60 No Bid NPS 42044 $191.99 MisC MWF-R60EF $857.32 NPS BT60R $228.00
6 VERTICAL STORAGE TABLE o NPS-DYMU No Bid NPS 42044 $352.99 MisC MWF-HRTC $966.65 NPS DYMU Table Cart $420.00
- NOR-NAF3072GR-
7 FOLDING TABLE i H NPS-BT3072 No Bid NPS 42044 $109.99 MisC - $211.84 NPS BT3072 $128.00
\
8 SENIOR TABLE 4 SICO-TTC61G No Bid NPS 42044 $1,878.99 Kl ECTRC29121PY-SY | $1,885.00 sico TTC61 $2,965.00
9 GRADUATE TABLE Co .’ SICO-STTB61G No Bid NPS 42044 $1,796.99 Kl ECTRD290508PY-SY| $1,854.84 sico SSTB61 $2,890.00
NPS. MTS10- ECTEL291010PY-
10 ADA PRESIDENTS TABLE '-':1':':-; SICO-TTN61G No Bid o — 42044 $1,878.99 K e $3,099.52 Sico TIN61 $2,921.00
—— LNT-GNI-SCI-
11 WOOD SCIENCE TBALE Iy rl DW-C7146K30N No Bid HON-Build 42044 $389.99 MisC i $578.51 WB/Diversified C7146K30N $1,509.00
T Lakeshore Learning |L Alternat HESW3054E
n; m
12 EXPANSE TABLE ACB-DTT-EX3054E re Leaming eAtemate|  ¢645.05 HON-Build 42044 $369.99 HON $347.57 Artcobell DTT-ex3054E $263.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC759 HEB4LEG
Lakeshore Learning |L Alternat HESH6066E
13 EXPANSE SHAPETABLE |, 1 ACB-DTT-EX3054E X e eAtemate|  ¢645.0 HON-Build 42044 $369.99 HON $564.63 Artcobell DTT-EX3054MB $375.00
T Materials, LLC Item #LC759 HEB4LEG
T Lakeshore Learning |L Alternat HESH3060E
14 NEBULA SHAPE TABLE | ACB-DTT-NB3054E e Learming chvematel  sss2s5 HON-Build 42004 $394.99 HON SH3 $364.10 Artcohell DIT-NB30S4E | $256.00
Materials, LLC Item #LK226 HEB4LEG
1 Lakeshore Learning |L Alternat HESKD4872E
15 KIDNEY SHAPED TABLE ACB-DTT-KD4872E re Leaming eAttemate|  <gg 55 HON-Build 42044 $516.99 HON SKD4g $493.29 Artcobell DTT-KD4872E $425.00
Materials, LLC Item #LK226 HEB4LEG
. " Lakeshore Learning |L Alternat HETR2460E
1 SHAPE TABLE l ACB-DTT-RC3072E e Learming chtlematel  sess.os HON-Build 42004 $390.99 HON $334.08 Artcohell DIT-RC3072E | $314.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC759 HEB4LEG
. " Lakeshore Learning |L Alternat
17 SHAPE TABLE TOP I ACB-DTT-RC3672E re Leaming eAtemate|  ¢645.05 HON-Build 42044 $390.99 HON HETR2460E $220.98 Artcobell DTT-RC3072MB $439.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC759
Lakeshore Learning |Lal Alternat HESKD4872E
18 ACTIVITY TABLE T ACB-1275F/ ACB-1250F re Learning eAltemate|  ¢gg 55 HON-Build 42044 $516.99 HON $493.26 Artcobell 1275F $499.00
Materials, LLC Item #LK226 HEB4LEG
- Lakeshore Learning |Lakeshore Alternat
19 RECTANGLE TABLE - '_L ACB-DTT-RC1872 re Leamning eAtemate|  ¢645.05 Hon 42044 $571.22 HON HMT2472E $837.81 Artcobell DTT-RC1872E $288.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC759
‘ ] Worthington NOR-UAL105RDD- _
20 46" ROUND TABLE ULT--358-RDV No Bid R 42044 $1,798.99 MisC e $1,390.51 Ultra-Site 358-RDV $1,767.00




Lakeshore Learning |Lak e Alternate
21 OVAL TABLE TOP ACB-DCT-RT3372F . $635.55 Hon 42044 $361.99 HON HFTLA3396 $495.47 Artcobell DCT-RT3372F $295.00
. Materials, LLC Item #LC641
22 TABLE BASE SET 1 I ACB-DCBR-1842 No Bid Hon 42044 $768.99 HON HFDB29AN $781.26 Artcobell DCBR-1842 $256.00
23 TLEG TABLE KIT I_ ~ L ACB-DTLT-2AS30 No Bid Hon 42044 $557.99 HON HMBTLEG24 $556.80 Artcobell DTLT-2AS30 $261.00
bar/counter-height teacher i EDAC1162-
23 ,g . r_ —l- New Item* No Reference Part No Bid Hon 42044 $750.99 HON HPWRMOD $227.94 Sico/Alliance 12???/BE03378- $4,378.00
tables w/ charging stations hE 0000136
24 TABLE BASE jL SICO-EDTB11 No Bid Hon 42044 $582.99 HON HBTTX30L $261.00 Sico EDTB11-30x42BF $308.00
GROUP A. TOTAL COST:|  $8,443.60 $18,341.98 $21,176.46 $30,217.00
OUPB.D
Lakeshore Alternate
1 Desk Combo 4 ACB-D75A3 Lakeshore Learning Item #LC517GA + Artcobell D75A3 $269.00
Materials, LLC #LC789 $557.64 HON-MOTIVATE® 42044 $369.99 Kil IWDEHBR $315.52
| L B | Lakeshore Learning Lakeshore Alternate
2 Aperture Desk ACB-DST-AP1830E Materials, LLC Item #LC787 $379.05 HON-SMARTLINK® 42044 $386.99 HON HESA3050E $384.98 G CEIFIEERNS PR
— Lakeshore Learning Lakeshore Alternate
3 Poly Book Box ACB-TA-BBP16 Materials, LLC Item #LC789 $464.55 HON-SMARTLINK® 42044 $567.50 HON HLDA-15 $148.77 izt LA (R0
Ty Lakeshore Learning Lakeshore Alternate DST-AP1830MB/Box of
4 Aperture Desk MB ACB-DST-AP1830E Materials, LLC Item #LC787 $379.05 HON-SMARTLINK® 42044 $386.99 HON HESA3050E $384.98 G 4 R
5 EL Pt h Desk T WB-PNH7365-AD) Lakeshore Learning Lakeshore Alternate o A BN e s
evate Plymouth Des = - - Materials, LLC Item #LK571 $474.05 WB Manufacturing 42044 $470.99 HON HETLEC-REC20 28 $413.25 isconsin Benc| P XD
6 Desk w Corner [ = COE-PL178L-ES No Bid NDI 42044 $465.99 HON H105816L $606.83 COE PL178L $646.00
7 Laminate Series Desk Shell — ACB-D75A3.3.4.G.1P No Bid NDI 42044 $211.99 HON H10592 $431.52 Artcobell D75A3 $269.00
GROUP B. TOTAL COST: $2,254.34 $2,860.44 $2,685.85 $2,360.00
o AIRS AND
1 Alphabet Series 18' Chair - ACB-AS4L18.3.4.93 Lakeshore Learning (L e Alternate Artcobell AS4L18 $135.00
"k Materials, LLC Item #LC845GA $189.05 NDI 42044 $185.99 HON HSS4L-188 $330.60
2 YES Series Task Chair !‘ OM-YS88-JR39 Lakeshore Learning (L e Alternate Office Master YS88-JR39 $580.00
- a * Materials, LLC Item #LC845GA $189.05 NDI 42044 $178.99 HON H5733 $310.59
3 YES Series High Back % COE-2028F Lak Learning |L e Alternate COE 2028F $149.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC845GA $189.05 NDI 42044 $258.99 HON HIWM2 $480.24
4 Alphabet Cantilever Chair el ACB-ASCL18.3.7.D Lakeshore Learning (L e Alternate Artcobell ASCL18 $167.00
- . Materials, LLC Item #LC767GA $160.55 Smith System 42044 $148.99 HON HSSCL-18B $486.33
5 Mesh Back Guest Chair % COE-2028F Lakeshore Learning |L e Alternate COE 2028F $268.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC767GA $160.55 NDI 42044 $98.99 HON HIGS6 $264.92
-
6 Cool mesh Back Guest Chair f COE-7944GNSF Lak Learning |L e Alternate COE 0OSSN6913 $330.00
sl Materials, LLC Item #LC767GA $160.55 NDI 42044 $162.99 HON HIGS6 $264.92
7 Stack Chair r [I » 1| ACB-AS4L18 Lakeshore Learning (L e Alternate Artcobell AS4L18 $135.00
| Materials, LLC Item #LC517GA $93.09 Smith System 42044 $95.99 HON HSS4L-18B $330.60
8 Mesh Chair COE-656MBFBK Lakeshore Learning (L e Alternate COE 656MMFBK $332.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC845GA $189.05 NDI 42044 $224.99 HON H5733 $310.59
9 Melody Chair NPS-8210 No Bid NPS 42044 $99.99 MISC NPS-8200 $127.99 NPS 8210 $117.00
10 Linear Chair FOM-F016-22x35-R3 L Learning (L e Alternate Fomcore F016-22x35-R3 $1,047.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC780SL $569.05 Fomcore 42044 $1,141.99 MISC LINEAR $1,180.00
11 ABC 4 Leg Chair ACB-As4118 L Learning |L e Alternate Artcobell AS4L16 $135.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC517GA $93.09 Smith System 42044 $95.99 HON HSS4L-18B $330.60
12 Discover Chair ACB-D10AC/ ACB-D10A L Learning |L e Alternate Artcobell D10AC/D10A $84.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC517GA $93.09 Smith System 42044 $82.99 HON HSS4L-18B $330.60
13 Plastic Folding Chair ) NPS-620 No Bid Ki 42044 $66.99 MISC NPS-600 $0.00 NPS 620 $229.00




14 Stool ACB-AS4ST30 L Learning |L e Alternate Artcobell AS4ST30 $208.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC637 $189.05 Kl 42044 $107.99 HON HE4LSTL30 $112.23
15 ABC 4 Leg Stool II ACB-AS4ST30 Lakesh Learning |La e Alternate Artcobell AS4ST24 $202.00
P Materials, LLC Item #LC637 $189.05 Smith System 42044 $127.99 HON HSS4L-30B $170.09
16 Round Ottoman - FOM-F005-18x18 Lakeshore Learning |Lakeshore Alternate Fomcore F005-18x18 $277.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC784MB $379.05 Fomcore 42044 $333.99 HON HFLY01 $277.10
= More
17 Accent Guard ?'*_ SIC0-8012-111 information Sico 8012 $33.00
' No Bid needed 42044 N/A N/A N/A
18 Crossway Collection Armless [ COE--2028VBK Lakeshore Learning |Lak e Alternate COE 2028VBK $152.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC767GA $160.55 NDI 42044 $93.99 HON HIGS6 $250.56
19 Booth seat_lr';gb::r Mutti App ‘ EDFB11-BG?G?-??? L Learning |L e Alternate No dimensions Sico EDFB11-BG?G?-??? | $5,831.00
i Materials, LLC Item #LC782SL $1,234.05 given 42044 Kl MPRB/AFT/NC $983.68
20 Booth Seating for Round = EDBO11-E2-G?G?-?? Lakeshore Learning |L e Alternate No dimensions Sico EDB011-E2-G?G?-??| $6,026.00
Table ’ Materials, LLC Item #LC783SL $1,424.05 given 42044 Kl MPCI60/AFT/NC $1,170.44
GROUP C. TOTAL COST: $5,661.97 $3,507.83 $7,712.08 $16,437.00
ROUP D A
1 BOOKCASE BRO-RP1-988-S00/ BRO-RP2-988-S00 L Learning |L e Alternate Toledo RP1-988C00 $656.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC230 $787.55 Hon 42044 $321.99 HON HS30ABC $170.09
2 Shelving Unit E ACB-A1260MBC L Learning |L e Alternate Artcobell A1260MBC $699.00
— Materials, LLC Item #LC230 $787.55 Hon 42044 $239.99 HON HESWLS42 $2,329.86
3 Reprise Single Shelving i BRO-RP-60-060-S00 No Bid Smith System 42044 $874.99 MISC HAL-4521-24 $603.99 Toledo RPARPTS00 $50.00
4 Reprise Starter Single —I BRO-RP7880S00 No Bid Smith System 42044 $959.99 MISC HAL-4721-24 $738.65 Toledo RP7880C00 $1,477.00
5 Reprise Adder Single j BRO-RP No Bid Smith System 42044 $842.99 MISC HAL-A4721-24 $629.32 Toledo RP 00 $1,162.00
6 Reprise 72" Partition = BRORPB620S00 No Bid Smith System 42044 $1,312.99 MISC HLE-3624SCL $1,549.32 Toledo RP 620C00 $114.00
7 Center Drawer Q COE-CDR1 No Bid NDI 42044 $58.99 HON HCD1 $73.95 COE CDR1 $79.00
8 Bookcase 31 1/2w COE--PL156CG Lakeshore Learning (L e Alternate COE PL156 $369.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC229 $645.05 NDI 42044 $356.99 HON H105533 $340.61
9 Storage Cabinet - COE--PL113CG Lakeshore Learning (L e Alternate COE 0S113 $400.00
1 Materials, LLC Item #LC288 $1,044.05 NDI 42044 $251.99 HON HFSC183664A $946.56
10 Poly Bookbox - ACB-TA-BBP16.9S No Bid Smith System 42044 $20.99 HON HLDA-15 $148.77 Artcobell TA-BBP16 $128.00
1 M“":(:fkuc:fes'ded I Z_ WB-LRD1140-363623ACP L Learning |L e Alternate WB/Diversified "RDn:g',s:sts' $1,289.00
g Materials, LLC Item #LC963 $1,139.05 WB 42044 $929.99 HON HESWLD42 $1,321.97
12 Large;l]ool:(lcl::’urved : | WB-LCD1245-603623ACP L Learning |L e Alternate WB/Diversified LCD12:Z—/6:3623- $3,200.00
o Materials, LLC Item #LC963 $1,139.05 WB 42044 $2,310.99 HON HESWC042 $1,411.58
13 Deluxe Full Pedestal . COE-PL166-ES/ COE-PL175-ES No Bid NDI 42044 $249.99 HON H105102 $482.85 COE 0S166/0S175 $393.00
14 2 Drawer Lateral File COE-PL112-ES No Bid NDI 42044 $431.99 HON H9180A $663.38 COE 0S112 $687.00
15 Open Hutch 35 1/2"w | ] COE-PL153ES No Bid NDI 42044 $207.99 HON H105292 $323.21 COE 05153 $335.00
16 71' Open Hutch ' COE-PL1440HCG No Bid NDI 42044 $324.99 HON H10534 $570.72 COE 0S1440H $468.00
17 Office Source Box/File [ ] COE-PL166CG/ COE-PL175CG No Bid NDI 42044 $249.99 HON H105106 $403.25 COE 05166/0S175 $393.00
GROUP D. TOTAL COST: $5,542.30 $9,947.83 $12,708.08 $11,899.00
RO A 0 & PAR
1 Whiteboard W/ Droptray AAR-WDS48144M No Bid Calyx 42044 $1,484.99 MISC LNT-0828N-SO $697.17 Aarco WDS48144M $766.00
2 Washer ) SIC0-120928 No Bid 42044 $1.00 N/A N/A N/A Sico 120928 $3.00
3 Push nut washer Q SIC0-000330 No Bid 42044 $1.00 N/A N/A N/A Sico Sico-000330 $3.00
4 Flange Washer - SIC0-121775 No Bid 42044 $1.00 N/A N/A N/A Sico 121775 $3.00
Can source just
5 Fastener | SIC0-102384 . more_ 42044 Sico 102384 $3.00
- information
H No Bid needed N/A N/A N/A




Can source just
6 Center Lock Arm SIC0-121771N . more- 42044 Sico 121771 $98.00
information
No Bid needed N/A N/A N/A
7 Robin's Nest b ] FOM-F536-45%21.25x39 No Bid Fomcore 42044 $3,092.99 N/A N/A N/A Fomcore F536-45x21.25x39 | $2,659.00
8 Robin's Egg FOM-F960-33x27x3 No Bid Fomcore 42044 $448.99 N/A N/A N/A Fomcore F960-33x27x3 $382.00
9 Cart = FOM-FK007-CART No Bid Smith System 42044 $159.99 HON HECART $482.85 Fomcore FK007-CART $271.00
10 Lily Pad FOM-FK007-18x3 Lakesh Learning |Lakeshore Alternate Smith System 42044 $56.99 Fomcore FK007-18x3 $136.00
) Materials, LLC Item #LC511GR $23.74 HON HELP1 $145.29
11 Amoeba r FOM-F006-48x33x18-G Lakeshore Learning |Lakeshore Alternate Fomcore 42044 $1,264.99 Fomcore F006-48x33x18-G $1,090.00
Materials, LLC Item #LC784SL $379.05 MISC SPG-1015XX-A $506.51
et Worthington .
12 Umbrella A ULT-7GCRA e Direcgt 42044 $615.99 N/A N/A N/A Ultra-Site 7GCRA $550.00
13 Umbrella B —— ULT-01-04-0484 giciiinzton 42044 $615.99 Ultra-Site 01-04-0484 $136.00
No Bid Direct N/A N/A N/A
14 Office Source Bridge COE-PL193CG No Bid NDI 42044 $117.99 HON H10560 $198.36 COE 05193 $190.00
15 Credenza Shell - COE-PL143CG No Bid NDI 42044 $226.99 HON H10541 $393.24 COE 05143 $327.00
16 Lami Doors COE-PL44LDCG No Bid NDI 42044 $32.99 HON N/A N/A COE 0S44LD $46.00
17 Fabric Tack Board Fits ] COE-PL118GR No Bid NDI 42044 $143.99 MISC BES-311AF $0.00 COE 0S118 $198.00
Can source just
18 SHAPE TABLE CASTERS ACB-TA-CPS4 . moreA 42044 Artcobell TA-CPS4 $41.00
information
Ll At No Bid needed HON HHABCASTER $48.99
Can source just
19 19" LEGS ACB-DTLP-4ATP B mure' 42044 Artcobell DTLP-4ATP $192.00
information
No Bid needed HON HEBY4LEG $85.70
GROUP E. TOTAL COST: $402.79 $8,265.88 $2,558.11 $7,094.00
BID TOTA $22,305.00 $42,923.96 $46,840.58 $68,007.00
TERRELL
LAKESHORE A SRR ENTERPRISE,
RESOURCESINC | CONSULING ING.
HON 53.30%
Quantity Discount 3-9 5% 0% KI 37% 5%
N HON 55%
Quantity Discount 10-49 5% 1% Kl 37% 5%
HON 56.5%
Quantity Discount 50-99 5% 2% K1 42% 5%
HON
Quantity Discount 100+ 5% 3% NEGOTIATED 5%
K142%
LAKESHOREL OFFFICE RESOURCES | DIVISION 12 TERRELL
REQUIRED FORMS MATERIALS, LLC INC CONSULING | ENTERPRISE, INC
Bid Form X X X X
Experience Statement X X X X
Notification of Intent to Respond X X X X
Non-Collusion Affidavit X X X X
Affidavit of Contractor X X X X
Jefferson County, Alabama Equal Employment Opportunity Certification Form X X X X
Debarment Statement X X X X
Signature Page X X X X
PACA Required Forms X X X X
Amendment #1 Acknowledgement X X X X
Amendment #2 Acknowledgement X X X X
Amendment #3 Acknowledgement X X X X
Jefferson County Business License
Insurance X




CONTACT INFORMATION

LAKESHORE LEARNING MATERIALS LLC/ CONTACT INFO: WILLIAM ROFFERS/ 2695 E. DOMINQUEZ STREET CARSON, LOS
ANGELAS, CA 90895/ PHONE: (800)-421-5354/ EMAIL: BIDDEPT@LAKESHORELEARNING.COM

OFFICE RESOURCES INC./ CONTACT INFO: BRAD GLOVER/ 225 HOLMES AVE # 125 HUNTSVILLE, ALABAMA, 35801/
PHONE: (949)-257-6980/ EMAIL: BGLOVERE@ORIUSA.COM

DIVISION 12 CONSULING, INC./ CONTACT INFO: MYCUS CARROLL/ 601 SOUTH COURT MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA 36104/
PHONE: (256)-658-4623/ EMAIL: MCARR@2DIVISION12.COM

TERRELL ENTERPRISES, INC./ CONTACT INFO: DEWEY A. BRANNON, JR./ P.O. BOX 461 GREENVILLE, ALABAMA
36037/ PHONE; (334)-382-7415/ EMAIL: AL@TERRELLENTERPRISES.COM




